BID TABULATION

LEON COUNTY AUDITOR'S OFFICE

PO BOX 898, 113 WEST MAIN STREET
CENTERVILLE, TEXAS 75833
903-536-2709 (W) 903-536-5801 (F)

IFB 2024-301 SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL
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VENDOR #1 VENDOR #2 VENDOR #3
TEXAS COMMERCIAL WASTE | FRONTIER WASTE SOLUTIONS WASTE CONNECTIONS
P.O. BOX 645 101 JENNINGS PKWY 812 ACR 367

BRYAN, TX 77806
RONALD SCHMIDT
979-775-7171

HILLSBORO, TX 76645
CLAY COX
888-854-2905

PALESTINE, TX 75801

903-723-4670

AWARDED 8-14-23

CENTERVILLE LOCATION

2 CU YD COMPACTOR W/40 YD RECEIVING CONTAINER QTY1 $170.00 PERMTH| QTY1 $700.00 PER MTH NO BID
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER QTY 3 $0.00 PER LOAD] QTY3 $620.00 PERLOAD
HAULING TRASH $290.00 PER LOAD $620.00 PER LOAD
LAND FEE $30.00 PER TON* $63.20 PERTON
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER (SCRAP METAL) | QTY 1 $35.00 PERMTH|] QTY1 $150.00 PER MTH
HAULING SCRAP METAL $286.50 PER LOAD $750.00 PER LOAD
JEWETT LOCATION

2 CU YD COMPACTOR W/40 YD RECEIVING CONTAINER QTY1 $170.00 PERMTH| QTY1 $700.00 PERMTH
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER QTY1 $0.00 PER LOAD] QTY1 $620.00 PERLOAD
HAULING TRASH $290.00 PER LOAD $620.00 PER LOAD
LAND FEE $30.00 PER TON* $63.20 PERTON
MARQUEZ LOCATION

2 CU YD COMPACTOR W/40 YD RECEIVING CONTAINER QTY1 $170.00 PERMTH| QTY1 $700.00 PER MTH
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER QTY 5 $0.00 PER LOAD] QTY5 $620.00 PERLOAD
HAULING TRASH $214.00 PER LOAD $620.00 PER LOAD
LAND FEE $30.00 PER TON* $63.20 PERTON
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER (SCRAP METAL) | QTY 1 $35.00 PERMTH|] QTY1 $150.00 PER MTH
HAULING SCRAP METAL $205.00 PER LOAD $750.00 PER LOAD
FLYNN/NORMANGEE LOCATION

2 CU YD COMPACTOR W/40 YD RECEIVING CONTAINER QTY1 $170.00 PERMTH| QTY1 $700.00 PER MTH
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER QTY 6 $0.00 PER LOAD] QTY6 $620.00 PERLOAD
HAULING TRASH $180.00 PER LOAD $620.00 PER LOAD
LAND FEE $30.00 PER TON* $63.20 PERTON
30 CU YD OPEN TOP ROLL OFF CONTAINER (SCRAP METAL) | QTY 1 $35.00 PERMTH| QTY1 $150.00 PER MTH
HAULING SCRAP METAL $172.00 PER LOAD $750.00 PER LOAD

* LAND FEE IS PASS-THRU FROM LANDFILL AND SUBJECT TO CHANGE

Commissioner Foley made the motion to accept Texas Commerical Waste proposal. Commissioner Workman seconded the motion. Motion carried.
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VENDOR #4 VENDOR #5 VENDOR #6 VENDOR #7
AMBIOTEC ENVIRONMENTAL | WEONIT WASTE & RECYCLE GAMMA WASTE SYSTEMS BVR WASTE & RECYCLING
P.0. BOX 2565 105 FIELDSTONE 712 PASADENA FWY. 8825 STEWARTS MEADOW
HARLINGEN, TX 78551 VICTORIA, TX 77901 PASADENA, TX 77506 COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845
CARLOS MARIN GREGORY McCURRY JOSEPH KAPPIL
956-423-7807 469-792-5387 713-472-6900 979-260-0006

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




